
Town of Ridgefield  Diesel & 87 Octane Gasoline & #2 Heating, Bid 16-17 Fiscal 2017

Delivery from Nov 2016 to June 2017

For Delivery starting Nov 2016 to June 2017

9/11/15 at 11am via invitation only with faxed or e-mailed prices Diesel 87 Octane #2 Heating Oil

 112,500              45,000                   10,000                 

Company Name Contact Phone Fax CTGRT = .08814 Jan 2017 - June

Standard Oil Bill Prince 203-334-5532x3002 203-337-3529 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bridgeport, CT    

Buckley Oil Lex Johnson 203-336-3541 x 1334 203-367-2412 1.9797$              1.7375$                 2.2449$               

Bridgeport, CT 222,716$            1.8906$                   22,449$               

85,079$                 

East River Don Herzog 203-453-1200 203-453-3899 2.0454$              1.7142$                 2.1241$               

Guilford, CT mary Ann/Collen 203-453-1200 x2015 230,108$            1.8653$                   21,241$               

83,938$                 

Dime Oil Thomas Kraft 203-754-5334 203-754-0790 2.0083$              1.7430$                 no bid

Waterbury CT Laurie / Jackie/ Tracy 225,934$            1.8966$                    
85,348$                 

Branchville Oil Paul Ciavarelli 544-8460 544-0060 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ridgefield, CT

Petroleum TradersGayle Newton 800-348-3705x6347 206-207-6347 1.9736$              1.6928$                 No Bid

Fort Wayne , NJ Joe Vanderpool 222,030$            1.8420$                    

82,890$                 

Barrel - $45  Total cost of contracts

Diesel 222,030$            112,500 gl

87 Octane 82,890$               45,000 gl

#2 Heating 21,241$               10,000 gl

Total 326,161$            

** Note : 87 Octane price will be charged a 8.814% Ct Gross reciepts tax on top of the bid price.

      That grossed up price is in small italized print under the base price per gallon

Boxed prices awarded bid for that product

Jerry Gay, C.P.P.B.Purchasing Director

Town of Ridgefield


